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nnual membership fee of Principal Forum and Representative of Management of Non Government colleges - principal@ch. .

Q, principal forum

Vikas Pissurlekar <vikjsp@yahoo.co.in>

1o me, Principal

Dear Madam

The annual membership fee is pending for years 2018-19,2019-20,
itis Rs 5000 x 4= Rs 20000.

i request you to kindly pay the same

thanks and regards

Dr. Vikas Pissurlekar

Principal PES Coliege

Principal Of Chowgule College <principai@chowgules.ac.in>
1o Vikas

Dear Sir

| will check with accounts and get back to you
Regards

Shaila Ghanti

Sent from my iPhone
> On 24-Mar-2022, at 11:22 PM, Vikas Pissurlekar <vikisp@yahoo.«

>

> Dear Madam

Principal Of Chowgule College <principal@chowgules.ac.inx
10 Accounts, Mahadev
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Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

inbox 1,139
From: Vikas Pissurlekar <vikisn@yahoo.co.in>

Starred Date: 24 March 2022 at 10:56:10 PM IST

To: Sanjay Sawant Dessai <principal@cescollege ac.in>

Ce: gffice@dempogollege.edu.in, princinali@dempocoliege.edu.in, zantyesdu@rediffmall com, info@dmscollege.ag.in, shresmallikarjuncollege@gmail.com, vmscl@rediffmail.com,
Sent fragnelcol@rediffimail.com, caculocollege@arail.com, principal@dhempecoliege.edu.in principal@chowgules.ac.in, mescollege 1@gmail.com, mescollege 1 @redifimail.com,
pal@carmelcofiegagoa.org. carmelcollege84@gamail.con, gvmece@yahoo.in cescac? 1@yahoo.co.in xavisrscoltege 196 3cdgmail.com, Ressrsnooidgmail.com,

Snoozed

Drafts guifegoeaz013@amail.com, svwmgoliege@yahoo.com, ganpatnarsekareducation@hotmail.com, principal@sive.ac.in, niegoa <piggea@gmiail.com>. principal sdec
Wibre <principal.sdocc@vvm.edu.in>, mandrecollege <mandrecollegs@yahoo.co.in>, gym.educol@@gmail.com. pringipal@rosarvcoliege.org, vidyaprabodhinigea@gmait.com,
principal.grkel@vyvm edu.in
Chat Subject: Re: Annual membership fees of the Forum of Principals and Representative of Managements of Non Government Colleges in Goa
Spaces Dear Sir/ Madam

following is the bank details you san Make online payment IRTGS

Saving bank  alc 20051424363
MICR code 403014002
IFSC code MAHB(Q@QWM

d aspace

regards

Meet
Dr Vikas J. Pissurlekar

Principal PES College of Arts and Science

‘ Primary Applicant {Jomt Appucane i




Parvatibai Chowgule College of Arts and Science Mail - Annual membership fee of Principal Forum and Representative of ..

Principal Of Chowgule College <principal@chowgules.ac.in>

Annual membership fee of Principal Forum and Representative of Management of
Non Government colleges

Principal Of Chowgule College <principal@chowgules.ac.in>
To: Accounts Chowgule college <accounts@chowgules.ac.in>, Mahadev Sawant <mss006@chowgules.ac.in>

Dear Mahadev
Refer to the trailing mail and let me know if we have paid annual membership fee.

Regards
Shaila Ghanti

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

Erom: Vikas Pissurlekar <vikjsp@yahco.co.in>
Date: 24 March 2022 at 11:22:07 PM IST
To: Principal <principal@chowgules.ac.in>, Principal Chowgule College <prin.chowgule@unigoa.ac.in>

Subject: Annual membership fee of Principal Forum and Representative of Management of Non
Government colleges

G

Dear Madam

The annual membership fee is pending for years 2018-19,2019-20, 2020-21 and 2021-22 .
itis Rs 5000 x4= Rs 20000.

i request you to kindly pay the same

thanks and regards

Dr. Vikas Pissurlekar

Principal PES College

https:lfmaiI.google.comfmaiIIuIO.’?ik=b56035060b&view=pt&search=aIl&permmsgid=msg-f%3A1 7282341549288383858dsqt=1&simpl=msg-f%3A... 1/1



